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PRICE: 1.830.000 €

PROPERTY TYPE: Villa 

CITY: Benitachell 

BEDROOMS: 4 

Bathrooms: 5

Build ( m2 ): 565

Plot ( m2 ): 931 

Terrace ( m2 ): - 

Year: -

Floor: -

Old price -

DESCRIPTION

Villa Luna is based on the space-creating concept Living IN&OUT, 
distributed on different floors, with open-plan and comfortable spaces, 
wherethe interior/exteriorcross over the limits and blur the boundaries. A 
project with light colours, wood and the presence of natural light. The 
access to the living area is on the top floor, with a hall, that takes the part 
of main distributor, and three bedrooms, two of which share a bathroom 
and spacious wardrobes, and one en-suite bedroom, all of them with 
access to a terrace area. On the lower floor, we will find the fourth 
bedroom of this villa, with an en-suite bathroom, a walk-in-closet and 
access to a terrace. The spectacular day area will not disappoint you. 
Made up of a kitchen with a central island where the cooking area sits 
and a breakfast bar, a spacious dining room and a living room. All of 
these connected to the exterior, with a big porch to be able to enjoy the 
fresh air.A stylish terrace encourages even more the idea of ?living 
outside? with several leisure areas next to the endless pool, the Jacuzzi 
and a barbecue area with an exterior dining area and a courtesy 
bathroom to enjoy the wonderful days of sun of which the Costa Blanca 
is known for. Villa Luna has more surprises, with a spacious and bright 



basement with a private terrace and porch. An open-plan area where you 
could make a leisure room, a gymnasium, a guest apartment, the options 
are endless. In this exclusive villa located on Cumbre del Sol it is 
possible to lose yourself and relax surrounded by incredible sea views.

ENERGETIC CERTIFIED



"OUR EXPERIENCE IS YOUR GUARANTEE"

VIEWS

Sea views

KITCHEN

Equipped kitchen
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